
Call for papers 

 

In collaboration with the Accounting History Review Workshop 2023, University of Messina, 28 
and 29 September 2023, we are pleased to announce a Special Issue of Accounting History 
Review: 

Accounting [in] History over time, space, and subjects: tradition, innovation, and 
hybridisation 

Guest editor:  Carmelo Marisca, University of Messina 

Accoun�ng history has become an increasingly prominent field of research, with an emphasis on 
the historical and social se�ng in which accoun�ng prac�ces and ideas develop. Accoun�ng 
history is also more interdisciplinary, drawing on theories and methodologies from fields such as 
economics, management, finance, sociology, anthropology, and psychology.  At the same �me, it 
is transna�onal, with more research co-authored by scholars coming from different countries, 
with their own iden��es, backgrounds, hybridising approaches and scien�fic advances. 
 
In recent years, a series of heterogeneous yet interconnected events has dras�cally changed 
people’s lives, organisa�ons, and socie�es: pandemics, economic downturns, natural disasters, 
wars – ongoing or simply feared. In this scenario, innova�on, sustainability transi�on, and new 
technologies – most recently, ar�ficial intelligence – are alterna�vely considered as an 
indispensable Copernican revolu�on, a renewal, a tool of power or as a cause of the events, at 
the base of seeking new global geopoli�cal equilibria. 
 
Accoun�ng, rather than seen as a purely technical prac�ce, is a social and cultural phenomenon 
that is shaped by its historical and ins�tu�onal context.  At the same �me, it inevitably moulds 
people, organisa�ons, and socie�es. In this perspec�ve, the examina�on of mul�-faceted social 
and ins�tu�onal contexts through an accoun�ng lens can enhance knowledge, thus helping to 
explain current dynamics and events and, at the same �me, contribu�ng to understanding and 
managing inevitable change. 
 
This Special Issue provides an addi�onal opportunity to demonstrate how scholars from different 
scien�fic backgrounds and countries, can foster interdisciplinary and cross-na�onal 
collabora�ons and/or research, explore the historical development of accoun�ng, discuss future 
trends in the field, and address new challenges. Theore�cal, empirical and review papers are 
welcomed in all areas of accoun�ng history.  This Special Issue call for papers dovetails with an 
earlier AHR collabora�on with the Academic Associa�on of Historians in Australian and New 
Zealand Business Schools (AAHANZBS) in 2018 and the subsequent 2020 issue, ‘Using 



interdisciplinary approaches to examine the historical context of contemporary business issues’ 
(Patmore and Westcot 2020). 

In Italy, the importance of interdisciplinarity in accoun�ng studies has been highlighted since the 
beginning of the twen�eth century by Fabio Besta (Besta 1909; Sargiacomo, Servalli, and Andrei, 
2012). Interdisciplinarity, influenced by the array of cultural iden��es and backgrounds exis�ng 
within different countries, varies in expression across space, linked with the concept of ‘discipline’.  
Moreover, it evolves over �me, reflec�ng the perpetually changing intellectual landscape of 
humanity and its categorisa�ons.  

This dynamism mirrors the dynamic nature of accoun�ng itself, which is both a product and 
shaper of historical and ins�tu�onal contexts. Indeed, interdisciplinarity assumed a pivotal role 
within accoun�ng history, and represents the core and the dis�nc�ve element of AHR (McWaters 
2014, 2017, 2018, 2020).  

In the contemporary global landscape, marked by a tapestry of heterogeneous events reshaping 
socie�es, organisa�ons, and individual lives, interdisciplinarity emerges defini�vely as a need and 
an accelerant for understanding, managing, and responding to these con�ngent transforma�ons. 
These events, ranging from pandemics and economic shi�s to natural disasters and geopoli�cal 
tensions, have underscored the pivotal role of interdisciplinarity in seeking innova�ve solu�ons 
and strategies to navigate change, thus hybridising approaches. 

Historical analysis, serving as a bridge between the past, present, and future, is enriched and 
for�fied by interdisciplinary approaches to address contemporary issues. Accoun�ng's pivotal 
role within organisa�ons, func�oning as a pervasive force that shapes decisions, strategies, and 
communica�on, further underscores the significance of this explora�ve endeavour.  
 
The guest editor and AHR editor will solicit and encourage submissions by scholars who have 
presented full papers at the Accounting History Review Workshop. However, while presenta�on 
at the conference is encouraged, it is not necessary to be considered for publica�on in the Special 
Issue. Following the workshop, the deadline for submission of the final version of all manuscripts 
is 30 November 2023. Upon submission, the referee and review process of all manuscripts will 
be in accordance with AHR editorial policy. 
 
For ques�ons and queries, please contact: 
 
Cheryl S. McWaters, Editor, Accoun�ng History Review [Cheryl.McWaters@uOtawa.ca] and/or 
Carmelo Marisca, Guest Editor [Carmelo.Marisca@unime.it]. 
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